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AMENDATORY ENDORSEMENT
NEBRASKA

Under Common Policy Conditions, Cancellation
is deleted and replaced by the following:

Cancellation or Nonrenewal -- "You" may
cancel this policy by returning the policy to "us"
or by giving "us" written notice and stating at
what future date coverage is to stop.

"We" may cancel or not renew this policy by
mailing written notice to "you" by registered,
certified, or first class mail at the address shown
on the "declarations". If sent by first class mail, a
United States postal certificate of mailing will be
sufficient proof of receipt of notice on the third
calendar day after the date of the certificate.
"Our" notice will state the reasons for
cancellation or nonrenewal.

During the first 60 days this policy is in effect,
"we" may cancel for any reason.

After this policy has been in effect 60 days or
more, or if it is a renewal of a policy issued by
"us", "we" may cancel or not renew only at the
anniversary date unless:

a. the premium has not been paid when due;

b. this policy was obtained through material
misrepresentation;

c. the risk originally accepted has substantially
increased;

d. "you" have submitted a fraudulent claim;

e. "you" have violated any of the "terms" and
conditions of the policy;

f. there is certification to the Director of
Insurance of "our" loss of reinsurance which
provided coverage for all or a substantial
part of the underlying risk insured; or

g. there is determination by the Director of
Insurance that the continuation of the policy
could place "us" in violation of the insurance
laws of this state.

If "we" cancel this policy for nonpayment of
premium, "we" will give "you" notice at least ten
days before cancellation is effective. If "we"
cancel this policy for any other reason, "we" will
give "you" notice at least 60 days before
cancellation is effective.

If "we" do not renew this policy, "we" will give
"you" notice at least 60 days before nonrenewal
is effective.

"Your" return premium, if any, will be refunded at
the time of cancellation or as soon as practical.
Payment or tender of the unearned premium is
not a condition of cancellation.
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